
CITY OF PORT ARTHUR TEXAS
Bid Tabulation

ROAD BUILDING MATERIALS
Bid Opening Date: May 26, 2010

)

I )

Name of Bidders
AMF Materials & Transport Transit Mix

FOB City's Delivered to FOB City's Delivered to
Item # Description UOM Stockpile FOB Plant Worksite Stockpile FOB Plant Worksite

Type 'PE' Grade 3 Precoated
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bidla aj!;j!;rej!;ate Ton

Type 'PE' Grade 4 Precoated
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No BidIb aggregate Ton

2 Blackbase Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Limestone Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.00 $19.00 $23.00*
4 610 Base Limestone Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.00 $35.00 $39.00

Type "D" Hotmix
5 Asphaltic concrete PVT Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hotmix Cold Laid Type "D"
6 Asphaltic Concrete Pavement Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 Romayor Sand Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.00 $25.00 $29.00

Cement Stabilized Sand
8 (Base Bid) Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.75 $16.75 $20.75

Y:z sack incremental increase
9a to base bid Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2.00 $ 2.00 $ 2.00

Y:z sack incremental decrease
9b to base bid Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2.00 $ 2.00 $ 2.00

Concrete Rubble
10 0"-8" size mixed Ton $22.00 $18.00 $22.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
lIa Hearth slag, 0" - 1Y:z" size Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
lIb Hearth slag, 1Y:z" - 3" size Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 Grade 3 Commercial Rock Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 Grade 4 Commercial Rock Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 5/8" Limestone Aggregate Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.50 $31.50 $35.50

Delivery time after order is placed 1 - 2 days 1 day
Location Port Arthur, TX Beaumont, TX
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ROAD BUILDING MATERIALS Bid Opening Date: May 26, 2010

)

)

Name of Bidders
Vulcan Construction Materials LP Vulcan Construction Materials LP
FOB City's Delivered to FOB City's Delivered to

Item # Description UOM Stockpile FOB Plant Worksite Stockpile FOB Plant Worksite
Type 'PE' Grade 3 Precoated

$69.50 No Bid $69.50 No Bidla aggregate Ton No Bid No Bid
Type 'PE' Grade 4 Precoated

$69.50 No Bid $69.50 No BidIb aggregate Ton No Bid No Bid
2 Blackbase Ton $84.00 No Bid $84.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Limestone Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.50 $15.50* $22.50
4 610 Base Limestone Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Type "D" Hotmix
5 Asphaltic concrete PVT Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hot-mix Cold Laid Type 'D'
6 Asphaltic Concrete Pavement Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 Romayor Sand Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cement Stabilized Sand
8 (Base Bid) Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Y2 sack incremental increase
9a to base bid Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Y2 sack incremental decrease
9b to base bid Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Concrete Rubble
10 0"-8" size mixed Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
lla Hearth slag, 0" - IW' size Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
llb Hearth slag, IW' - 3" size Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 Grade 3 Commercial Rock Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 Grade 4 Commercial Rock Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 5/8" Limestone Aggregate Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery time after order is placed 5 days 1 day
Location San Antonio, TX Nederland, TX

*TWIC card required for Port entry
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ROAD BUILDING MATERIALS Bid Opening Date: May 26, 2010

)

)

Name of Bidders
Knife River Corporation

FOB City's Delivered to
Item # Description UOM Stockpile FOB Plant Worksite

Type 'PE' Grade 3 Precoated
No Bid No Bid No Bidla aggregate Ton

Type 'PE' Grade 4 Pre-coated
No Bid No Bid No BidIb aggregate Ton

2 Blackbase Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Limestone Ton $21.50/trailer No Bid $21.50/trailer
4 610 Base Limestone Ton $40.00/trailer $35.00 $40.00/trailer

Type "D" Hot-mix
5 Asphaltic concrete PVT Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hot-mix Cold Laid Type 'D'
6 Asphaltic Concrete Pavement Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 Romayor Sand Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cement Stabilized Sand
8 (Base Bid) Ton $21.50/tandem $15.50 $21.50/tandem

Y2 sack incremental increase
9a to base bid Ton $3.00 No Bid $3.00

Y2 sack incremental decrease
9b to base bid Ton $3.00 No Bid $3.00

Concrete Rubble
10 0" -8" size mixed Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
lla Hearth slag, 0" - IW' size Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
llb Hearth slag, 1W' - 3" size Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 Grade 3 Commercial Rock Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 Grade 4 Commercial Rock Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 5/8" Limestone Aggregate Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivery time after order is placed As Required,vk:Loeatlon ,
Beaumont, TX

/vAr, l<-~'~~ (fn/
Shawna Tubbs, Purchasing Manager

Date
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