CITY OF PORT ARTHUR TEXAS
BID TABUALTION SHEET

Petroleum Oils and Lubricants
Bid Opening Date: June 2, 2010

NAME OF BIDDER
Tri-Con , Inc. Universal Lubricgnts Derrick Oil & Supply Inc.
Item # Description UOM UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST

1 Anti-Freeze (Ethylene Glycol) 1 gallon containers $5.86 NO BID $5.10

2 Anti-Freeze (Extended Life) 1 gallon containers $9.99 NO BID NO BID

3 Automatic Transmission Fluid quart containers $2.31 $2.80/qt. or $16.79/case $1.77

4 Automatic Transmission Fluid 55-gallon drums $396.89 $345.00 $366.68

5 Chassis Grease 120- pound pails $245.38 $235.00 $236.30/keg
6 Chassis Grease 14 ounce tubes $21.42/box of 10 $1.90 $1.78

7 Engine oil SAE 10W30 Multi-grade quart containers $2.40 $2.81/qt or $16.85/case $1.97

8 Engine oil SAE 15W40 Multi-grade 55-gallon drum containers $441.89 $344.00 $472.14

9 Engine oil SAE 15W40 Multi-grade quart containers $2.37 $3.10/qt or $18.59/case $2.02

10 Engine oil SAE 40W quart containers $2.28 NO BID $2.01

11 Engine oil SAE 80W90 55-gallon drums $533.73 NO BID $426.05

12 Engine oil SAE 80W90 5-gallon pails $50.94 NO BID $40.15

13 Hydraulic oil ISO 68AW 55-gallon drums $301.29 $279.40 $358.89

14 Hydraulic oil ISO 68AW 5-gallon pails $29.15 $33.50 $31.06

15 Power Steering Fluid quart containers $1.44 NO BID $1.69

16 Transmission-Differential-Hydraulic 5-gallon pails $43.62 NO BID $37.95

(TDH) oil
Location Beaumont, TX Wichita, KS Port Arthur, TX
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Shawna Tubbs, Purchasing Manager
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