CITY OF PORT ARTHUR TEXAS
Bid Tabulation

Ground Maintenance for Utility Operations
GROUPS A,B,C,D,E, F, G, IN THE CITY OF PORT ARTHUR

Bid Opening Date: June 2, 2010

Names of Bidders
Trey’s Sandra’s NVT Tomahawk
Meyer Smith| Dbuilders, Affordable Tractor Enterprises, | Construction,| M & J’s Lawn
Item # | UOM | Description Inc. LLC Lawn Care Service Inc. LLC Lawn Service
1 Cuts |Group A $746.60 $3,000.00 $170.00 NO BID $310.00 $1,900.00 $8,450.00 $225.00
2 Cuts |Group B $897.39 $3,700.00 $200.00 $490.00 $405.00 $3,000.00 $1,605.00 $274.98
3 Cuts |Group C $555.90 $2,100.00 NO BID $260.00 $285.00 $2,100.00 $7,250.00 $220.00
4 Cuts {Group D $500.37 $2,000.00 NO BID $165.00 $235.00 $3,500.00 $6,130.00 $160.00
5 Cuts |Group E $690.99 $2,800.00 NO BID NO BID $295.00 $2,200.00 $10,050.00 $215.00
6 Cuts |Group F $635.41 $27,000.00 $1,995.00 $1,540.00 $1,500.00 $5,400.00 $7,250.00 | $1,360.00
7 Cuts |Group G NO BID $5,200.00 NO BID $1,475.00 $385.00 $6,000.00 $5,000.00 NO BID
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Shawna Tubbs, Purchasing Manager Date
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