CITY OF PORT ARTHUR TEXAS

Bid Tabulation

Demolition of 25 Properties with Transite Siding

Bid Opening Date: June 23,2010

Name of Bidder
Golden Triangle Homes, Inc. Lark Group, Inc. Coastal Demolition, Inc. McFeniel Services, LLC.
Days to Days to Days to Days to
Item # Description Complete Cost Complete Cost Complete Cost Complete Cost
1 Group A-t 12 $28,575.00 Bid Disqualified - NO BID Bid Disqualified
2 Group B-t 17 $35,585.00 Bid Disqualified - NO BID Bid Disqualified
3 Group C-t 15 $31,945.00 Bid Disqualified - $23,250.00 Bid Disqualified
4 Group D-t 17 $36,380.00 Bid Disqualified - NO BID Bid Disqualified
5 Group E-t 16 $36,250.00 Bid Disqualified - NO BID Bid Disqualified
Location Lumberton, TX Port Arthur, TX Beaumont, TX Sugarland, TX
Name of Bidder
A & R Demolition Beaumont Demolition Group, Inc. Resurgence Demo & Environmental J&J Insulation & Acoustics, Inc.
Days to Days to Days to Days to
Item # Description Complete - Cost Complete Cost Complete Cost Complete Cost
1 Group A-t - $28,390.00 13 $15,950.00 15 $30,417.00 23 $57,740.00
2 Group B-t - $51,283.00 14 $21,400.00 17 $40,451.00 33 $81,850.00
3 Group C-t - $34,603.00 13 $16,850.00 17 $41,149.00 23.5 $60,150.00
4 Group D-t - $52,222.00 17 $22,150.00 19 $48,280.00 30 $78,950.00
5 Group E-t - $30,680.00 13 $15,900.00 15 $30,935.00 24.5 $64,050.00
Location DelValle, TX Beaumont, TX Carrollton, GA Corpus Christi, TX
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Shawna Tubbs, Purchasing Manager
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